
 

 

 
 
 
 
 

NOTICE OF MAKING OF AN ORDER 
HIGHWAYS ACT 1980 

 
PUBLIC PATH DIVERSION ORDER 

FOOTPATH 29 HATFIELD PEVEREL 
IN THE DISTRICT OF BRAINTREE 

 
The above order, made on 10 February 2025, under section 119 of the Highways Act 1980, will 
divert a part length of Footpath 29 Hatfield Peverel commencing from a point in front of the 
entrance gateway to Chase Cottage, Wickham Bishops Road, Hatfield Peverel CM3 2JL at grid 
reference 58089,21191, proceeding north north-westward through the gateway, along the driveway 
then through a boundary fence into wooded scrubland, then continuing in a west south-westward 
direction through the scrubland passing north of Sandford’s Farm outbuildings to the field edge 
where the path then proceeds in a general north north-westward direction along the headland to a 
point approximately 20 metres southeast of the hedge gap into the next field, to an alternative route 
commencing from the aforementioned point at the Chase Cottage gateway proceeding in a west 
south-westward direction adjacent to the garden fencing then heading north north-westward 
between Chase Cottage garden fencing and Sandford’s Farm outbuildings where it then continues 
generally north westward through a thicket to the aforementioned point at the field edge southeast 
of the hedge gap, as shown on the order map. 
 
A copy of the order and order map can be requested to be posted by emailing 
publicpathorders@essexhighways.org or is available to be viewed at Chelmsford Public Library, 
Market Road, CM1 1QH during normal working hours. Copies are also available on Essex Highways 
website at: https://www.essexhighways.org/public-path-notices and have also been sent to 
Braintree District and Hatfield Peverel Parish Councils. 
 
Any representations about or objections to the order may be sent in writing to Andrew Ritchings, 
Definitive Map Service, Essex County Council, Seax House, 2nd Floor, Victoria Road South, 
Chelmsford CM1 1QH no later than 28 March 2025. Please state the grounds on which they are 
made.  
 
If no such representations or objections are duly made, or if any so made are withdrawn, Essex 
County Council may confirm the order as an unopposed order. If an order is sent to the Secretary of 
State for the Environment for confirmation, any representations or objections which have not been 
withdrawn will be sent together with the order. Any such representations or objections will be taken 
into account by the Council with the result that they may be made available to the public under the 
Local Government (Access to Information) Act 1985. 
 
Dated 27 February 2025.  
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